

CERTIFICATE of COURSE COMPLETION

Public Information Act

I, **JOHN L. HORN**, certify that I have completed a course of training on the Texas Public Information Act that satisfies the legal requirements of Government Code, Section 552.012.

Certificate is issued effective this 8th day of January, 2015.



JENNIFER LINDENZWEIG
County Clerk, Hunt County, Tex.
By *J. Lindenzweig*

JAN 27 2015

FILED FOR RECORD
at 10:35 o'clock A M

13,545(1)

NOTICE TO CERTIFICATE HOLDER: You are responsible for the safekeeping of this document as evidence that you have completed this open government training course. The Office of the Attorney General does not maintain a record of course completion for you and is unable to issue duplicate certificates. Government Code Section 552.012(e) requires the governmental body with which you serve to maintain this Certificate of Course Completion and make it available for public inspection.

Certificate No.: 15-194391P

CERTIFICATE of COURSE COMPLETION

Open Meetings Act

I, **JOHN L. HORN**, certify that I have completed a course of training on the Texas Open Meetings Act that satisfies the legal requirements of Government Code, Section 551.005.

Certificate is issued effective this 8th day of January, 2015.



#13,545(2)

FILED FOR RECORD
at 10:35 o'clock A M

JAN 27 2015

JENNIFER LINDENZWEIG
County Clerk, Hunt County, Tex
By *Jennifer Lindenzweig*

NOTICE TO CERTIFICATE HOLDER: You are responsible for the safekeeping of this document as evidence that you have completed this open government training course. The Office of the Attorney General does not maintain a record of course completion for you and is unable to issue duplicate certificates. Government Code Section 551.005(c) requires the governmental body with which you serve to maintain this Certificate of Course Completion and make it available for public inspection.

Certificate No.: 15-194390M

CERTIFICATE OF PARTICIPATION

The V.G. Young Institute of County Government

Awards This Certificate To

Jennifer Lindenzweig

For Successfully Completing 1.00 Hours of Educational Training

Titled
Registry of the Court

January 9, 2015

#13,545(3)

FILED FOR RECORD
at 10:35 o'clock A M

JAN 27 2015

JENNIFER LINDENZWEIG
County Clerk, Hunt County, TX.
By *J. Lindenzweig*



TEXAS A&M
AGRILIFE
EXTENSION

TLDR #: 1664

CERTIFICATE OF PARTICIPATION

The V.G. Young Institute of County Government

Awards This Certificate To

Jennifer Lindenzweig

For Successfully Completing 1.00 Hours of Educational Training

Titled
Fraudulent Filings

January 9, 2015

13,545(4)

FILED FOR RECORD
at 10:35 o'clock A M

JAN 27 2015

JENNIFER LINDENZWEIG
County Clerk, Hunt County, Tex.

By *J. Lindenzweig*



TEXAS A&M
AGRI LIFE
EXTENSION

TLDR #: 1664

CERTIFICATE of COURSE COMPLETION

Open Meetings Act

I, **Timothy S Linden**, certify that I have completed a course of training on the Texas Open Meetings Act that satisfies the legal requirements of Government Code, Section 551.005.

Certificate is issued effective this 7th day of January, 2015.



#13,545(5)

FILED FOR RECORD
at 10:35 o'clock A M

JAN 27 2015

JENNIFER LINDENZWEIG
County Clerk, Hunt County, Tex.
By *Jennifer Lindenzweig*

NOTICE TO CERTIFICATE HOLDER: You are responsible for the safekeeping of this document as evidence that you have completed this open government training course. The Office of the Attorney General does not maintain a record of course completion for you and is unable to issue duplicate certificates. Government Code Section 551.005(c) requires the governmental body with which you serve to maintain this Certificate of Course Completion and make it available for public inspection.

Certificate No.: 15-194337M

#13,545(6)

FULL EXEMPTION RACIAL PROFILING REPORT

Agency Name: HUNT CO. CONST. PCT. 2
Reporting Date: 01/12/2015
TCOLE Agency Number: 231102
Chief Administrator: WAYNE PIERCE
Agency Contact Information: Phone: 903-886-7937
Email: wpierce@huntcounty.net
Mailing Address:
HUNT CO. CONST. PCT. 2
P.O. Box 411
Commerce, Tx 75429

FILED FOR RECORD
at 10:35 o'clock A M
JAN 27 2015
JENNIFER LINDENZWEIG
County Clerk, Hunt County, Tex.
By *[Signature]*

Article 2.132 CCP Law Enforcement Policy on Racial Profiling

(a) In this article:

(1) "Law enforcement agency" means an agency of the state, or of a county, municipality, or other political subdivision of the state, that employs peace officers who make traffic stops in the routine performance of the officers' official duties.

I certify it is not the policy of this agency to make traffic stops in the routine performance of the officers' official duties.

Executed by: WAYNE PIERCE

Chief Administrator

HUNT CO. CONST. PCT. 2

Date: 01/12/2015

Submitted electronically to the



The Texas Commission on Law Enforcement

13,545(7)

FILED FOR RECORD
at 10:35 o'clock A M

JAN 27 2015

JENNIFER LINDENZWEIG
County Clerk, Hunt County, Tex.
By *Jennifer Lindenzweig*

CERTIFICATE of COURSE COMPLETION

Public Information Act

I, **Tod McMahan**, certify that I have
completed a course of training on the Texas Public Information Act that satisfies the
legal requirements of Government Code, Section 552.012.

Certificate is issued effective this 12th day of January, 2015.



NOTICE TO CERTIFICATE HOLDER: You are responsible for the safekeeping of this document as evidence that you have completed this open government training course. The Office of the Attorney General does not maintain a record of course completion for you and is unable to issue duplicate certificates. Government Code Section 552.012(e) requires the governmental body with which you serve to maintain this Certificate of Course Completion and make it available for public inspection.

Certificate No.: 15-194516P

#13,545(9)

**COMMISSIONERS
CERTIFICATION FOR CREDIT**

FILED FOR RECORD
at 10:35 o'clock A M

JAN 27 2015

JENNIFER LINDENZWEIG
By County Clerk, Hunt County, Tex.
[Signature]

Seminar for Newly Elected County Judges and Commissioners
(Title of Conference)

AT&T Executive Education and Conference Center - Austin TX
(Place of Conference)

January 13-16, 2015
(Date of Conference)

LBJ School of Public Affairs The University of Texas at Austin
in cooperation with the Texas Association of Counties
(Sponsor of Conference)

I, (print name) Tod Mc Mahan, do hereby certify that I attended the above-listed conference and was present at the course of instruction for which I am claiming Continuing Education Credit.

I make this certification for the purpose of receiving credit for 20.5 hours of Continuing Education for the calendar year of 2015.

I represent and declare all the above statements are true and correct.

Dated: 1-16-2015

Tod Mc Mahan
Signature

Judge

Commissioner PCT. 2

Hunt
(County)

xxx-xx- 5120
(Last Four Digits - Social Security Number)

RETURN ORIGINAL (white) FORM TO:

LBJ School registration desk at end of conference.
Please retain the yellow copy for your records.

CERTIFICATE of COURSE COMPLETION

Open Meetings Act

I, **Tod McMahan**, certify that I have completed a course of training on the Texas Open Meetings Act that satisfies the legal requirements of Government Code, Section 551.005.

Certificate is issued effective this 20th day of January, 2015.



#13,545(8)

FILED FOR RECORD
at 10:35 o'clock A M

JAN 27 2015

JENNIFER LINDENZWEIG
County Clerk (Hunt County, Tex.)
By *Jennifer Lindenzweig*

NOTICE TO CERTIFICATE HOLDER: You are responsible for the safekeeping of this document as evidence that you have completed this open government training course. The Office of the Attorney General does not maintain a record of course completion for you and is unable to issue duplicate certificates. Government Code Section 551.005(c) requires the governmental body with which you serve to maintain this Certificate of Course Completion and make it available for public inspection.

Certificate No.: 15-194866M

13,549

FILED FOR RECORD
at 10:35 o'clock A M

FEE SCHEDULE

Effective Date January 1, 2015

Hunt County Clerk

Jennifer Lindenzweig

P.O. Box 1316 Greenville, TX 75403

(903) 408-4130

JAN 27 2015

JENNIFER LINDENZWEIG
County Clerk, Hunt County, Tex.

By *J. Lindenzweig*

Property records can be searched online by going to www.huntcounty.net and using the link provided or using www.countygovernmentrecords.com
LGC: Local Government Code PC: Property Code TxBCC: Texas Business & Commerce Code Tx AgC: Texas Agriculture Code
TAC: Texas Administrative Code HSC: Health & Safety Code GC: Texas Government Code

Recording Fee (first page)	RECRD	LGC §118.011	\$ 5.00
Records Management	CCRMF	LGC §118.011(b)(2)	\$ 10.00
Records Archive	CCRAF	LGC §118.011(f)	\$ 10.00
Courthouse Security	CHS	LGC §291.008(d)	\$ 1.00
TOTAL (first page)			\$ 26.00
Each additional page or part on which there are visible marks of any kind	RECD2	LGC §118.011(a)(1)	\$ 4.00
Each additional name to be indexed in excess of five (5)	CC	LGC §118.011(a)(2)	\$.25

The County Clerk's office requests a minimum of 1" at the top of the first page and 4" at the bottom of the last page for recording purposes. For filing requirements and additional fees that may be charged, please review the following statutes: Texas Property Code 11.003, 12.001(b), 12.011; Local Government Code 191.007

Recording Fee	RECRD	PC § 14.005	\$ 10.00
Record Management	CCRMF	LGC § 118.011(b)(2)	\$ 10.00
Record Archive	CCRAF	LGC § 118.011(f)	\$ 10.00
Courthouse Security	CHS	LGC § 291.008(d)	\$ 1.00
TOTAL			\$ 31.00

Recording Fee	RECRD	LGC §118.011	\$ 5.00
Records Management	CCRMF	LGC §118.011(b)(2)	\$ 10.00
Courthouse Security	CHS	LGC §291.008(d)	\$ 1.00
TOTAL (first page)			\$ 16.00

Recording Fee	RECRD	LGC § 118.011(c)	\$ 45.00
Record Management	CCRMF	LGC § 118.011(b)(2)	\$ 10.00
Record Archive	CCRAF	LGC § 118.011(f)	\$ 10.00
Courthouse Security	CHS	LGC § 291.008(d)	\$ 1.00
TOTAL			\$ 66.00

Plat with extra pages	RECD2	fee per extra page	\$ 5.00
-----------------------	-------	--------------------	---------

Certified Copies	CCOPY	(one page)	\$ 10.00
		Each additional page	\$ 2.00
Uncertified Copies (plain copies)	UCOPY	(one page)	\$ 5.00
		Each additional page	\$ 2.00

Recording Fee (first page)	RECRD	LGC §118.011	\$ 5.00
Records Management	CCRMF	LGC §118.011(b)(2)	\$ 10.00
Records Archive	CCRAF	LGC §118.011(f)	\$ 10.00
Courthouse Security	CHS	LGC §291.008(d)	\$ 1.00
TOTAL (first page)			\$ 26.00
Each additional page or part on which there are visible marks of any kind	RECD2	LGC §118.011(a)(1)	\$ 4.00
Each additional name in excess of five (5)	CC	LGC §118.011(a)(2)	\$.25

UCC				
Recording Fee	RECRD	TX BCC § 9.525	\$ 15.00	for Two pages or less;
			\$ 30.00	for Three pages or more
Record Management	CCRMF	LGC § 118.011(b)(2)		\$ 10.00
Record Archive	CCARF	LGC § 118.011(f)		\$ 10.00
Courthouse Security	CHS	LGC § 291.008(d)		\$ 1.00
		TOTAL	\$ 36.00	Or \$ 51.00
UCC-1 and UCC-3 are accepted for filing in the Real Property Records if the collateral is timber, mineral, oil, gas				
Which filing office is the correct place to file? A or B				
A. County Clerk for the filing or recording of a mortgage on the related real property if:				
1. the collateral is as-extracted collateral or timber to be cut; or				
2. the financing statement is filed as a fixture filing and the collateral is goods that are or are to become fixtures; or				
B. The Texas Secretary of State in all other cases.				
ASSUMED NAME CERTIFICATE (includes indexing of 2 names) (indexing of Business & 1 Owner Name)				
Applications available on the county website: www.huntcounty.net				
Recording Fee	CC	TxBCC § 71.155(a)(1)(2)	\$	3.00
Record Management	CCRMF	LGC § 118.011(b)(2)	\$	10.00
Record Archive	CCRAF	LGC § 118.011(f)	\$	10.00
Courthouse Security	CHS	LGC § 291.008(d)	\$	1.00
		TOTAL	\$	24.00
<i>Each Additional Name indexed</i>	CC	TxBCC § 71.115(a)(2)	\$.50
Assumed Name Abandonment (includes indexing of 2 names) (indexing of Business & 1 Owner Name)				
Applications available on the county website: www.huntcounty.net				
Recording Fee	CC	TxBCC § 71.155	\$	3.00
Record Management	CCRMF	LGC § 118.011(b)(2)	\$	10.00
Record Archive	CCRAF	LGC § 118.011(f)	\$	10.00
Courthouse Security	CHS	LGC § 291.008(d)	\$	1.00
		TOTAL	\$	24.00
<i>EACH ADDITIONAL NAME INDEXED</i>	CC		\$.50
Assumed Name Searches			\$	5.00
Assumed Name Copies				
Certified Copies	CCOPY		\$	6.00
Uncertified Copies (plain copy)	UCOPY		\$	1.00
POSTING PUBLIC NOTICES: Including Trustee/Foreclosure Sales				
Recording Fee	CC	PC § 51.002(f); LGC § 118.011(c)	\$	2.00
Courthouse Security Fee	CHS	LGC § 291.008(d)	\$	1.00
		TOTAL	\$	3.00
Trustee and Foreclosure Sales are conducted the first Tuesday of every month and will be located at the common area at the base of the Central stairway on the 2 nd floor inside the Courthouse, or the base of the North steps outside of the Courthouse; in the event the Courthouse is closed on the first Tuesday of the month.				
(**Passed by Commissioner's Court 1-8-2013, #12,598; Document #2013-911 recorded in Property Records.)				
NOTICE OF FORECLOSURE/TRUSTEE SALES MAY BE VIEWED AT www.huntcounty.net				
CATTLE BRAND APPLICATION/RELEASE OF OWNERSHIP				
Applications available on the county website: www.huntcounty.net				
Recording Fee (one brand/one location)	CC	LGC § 118.020(a)(9) TxAgC § 144.110	\$	5.00
Record Management	CCRMF	LGC § 118.011(b)(2)	\$	10.00
Record Archive	CCRAF	LGC § 118.011(f)	\$	10.00
Courthouse Security	CHS	LGC § 291.008(d)	\$	1.00
		TOTAL	\$	26.00
<i>Each Additional Brand Location</i>	CC	Recorded at the same time only	\$	5.00
TRASH HAULER PERMIT Application Form available at: www.huntcounty.net				
Must present application, payment, map indicating route, proof of insurance				\$ 25.00
JUNKYARD PERMIT				
Filing fee				\$ 25.00
<i>Must be approved through Commissioner Court</i>				

ALCOHOL LICENSE			
Clerk's certification fee		LGC §118.011(a)(3)	\$ 5.00
Protest Hearing fee	Must be paid by applicant prior to Hearing Schedule	TABC 61.31(c)	\$ 25.00
MILITARY DISCHARGE (DD214)			
FILING		LGC §192.002(b)	No Charge
CERTIFIED COPY		TGC § 603.003(a)	No Charge
<i>Thank you for your service.</i>			
BIRTH/DEATH VERIFICATION: Hunt County Only			
Search Fee	CC	LGC § 18.015(a), TAC § 181.22(g)	\$ 10.00
Texas Online Fee	CC	TAC § 181.22(s)	\$ 10.00
Vital Statistics Preservation Fee	BDMCC	HSC § 191.0045	\$ 1.00
TOTAL			\$ 21.00
BIRTH CERTIFICATES: If Born outside Hunt County-available on short form only			
Applications available on the county website: www.huntcounty.net			
Search/Certificate/County Clerk Fee	CC	LGC 118.015(a), TAC § 181.22, HSC 191.0045	\$ 20.20
Vital Statistics Fee	BC/ST	HSC § 191.0045	\$ 1.80
Vital Statistics Preservation Fee	BDMCC	HSC § 191.0045	\$ 1.00
TOTAL			\$ 23.00
DEATH CERTIFICATES			
<i>Hunt County Only</i>			
Applications available on the county website: www.huntcounty.net			
Search/Certificate/County Clerk Fee	CC	LGC 118.015(a), TAC § 181.22(b)(s), HSC 191.0045	\$ 20.00
Vital Statistics Preservation Fee	BDMCC	HSC § 191.0045	\$ 1.00
TOTAL			\$ 21.00
Each Additional Copy			
<i>Ordered at the same time</i>			
County Clerk Fee	CC	HSC § 191.0045	\$ 3.00
Vital Statistics Preservation Fee	BDMCC	HSC § 191.0045	\$ 1.00
TOTAL			\$ 4.00
INFORMAL MARRIAGE LICENSE			
License Fee	ML/CC 12.50 ML/ST 12.50	LGC § 118.011(a)(8)	\$ 25.00
Records Management	CCRMF	LGC § 118.011(b)(2)	\$ 10.00
Records Archive Fee	CCRAF	LGC § 118.011(f)	\$ 10.00
Courthouse Security Fee	CHS	LGC § 291.008(d)	\$ 1.00
Vital Statistics Preservation Fee	BDMCC	HSC § 191.0045	\$ 1.00
TOTAL			\$ 47.00
MARRIAGE LICENSE without Texas Premarital Education Certificate			
License Fee	ML/CC 30.00 ML/ST 20.00 ML/FTF 10.00	LGC § 118.011(a)(7)	\$ 60.00
Records Management	CCRMF	LGC § 118.011(b)(2)	\$ 10.00
Records Archive Fee	CCRAF	LGC § 118.011(f)	\$ 10.00
Courthouse Security Fee	CHS	LGC § 291.008(d)	\$ 1.00
Vital Statistics Preservation Fee	BDMCC	HSC § 191.0045	\$ 1.00
72 hour waiting period from date of application before the license can be used. TOTAL			\$ 82.00
MARRIAGE LICENSE with Texas Premarital Education Certificate			
License Fee	ML/CC 30.00 ML/ST 20.00 ML/FTF 10.00	LGC § 118.011(a)(7)	\$ <i>waived</i>
Records Management	CCRMF	LGC § 118.011(b)(2)	\$ 10.00
Records Archive Fee	CCRAF	LGC § 118.011(f)	\$ 10.00
Courthouse Security Fee	CHS	LGC § 291.008(d)	\$ 1.00
Vital Statistics Preservation Fee	BDMCC	HSC § 191.0045	\$ 1.00
72 hour waiting period is waived. TOTAL			\$ 22.00
CERTIFIED COPY of MARRIAGE LICENSE: Hunt County Records Only			
Search Fee	CC	TAC § 181.22(h)	\$ 10.00
Texas Online Fee	CC	TAC § 181.22(s)	\$ 10.00

Vital Statistics Preservation Fee	BDMCC	HSC § 191.0045	\$ 1.00
TOTAL			\$ 21.00
For information regarding a marriage by proxy, marriage to an incarcerated person, marriage of deployed soldier or marriage of a person less than 18 years of age, please contact the County Clerk's Office for regulations and requirements.			
Copies:			
Plain	UCOPY	LGC § 118.011(a)(3)	\$1.00 per page
Certified	CCOPY	LGC § 118.011(a)(4)	\$5.00 + \$1.00 per page
Authenticated copies (Clerk certifies twice)	CCOPY		\$10.00 + \$1.00 per page
Original filing of Probate of Will, Guardianship, Administration of Estate			
Probate Fee Original Action	PROB	LGC § 118.052(2)(A)(i)	\$ 40.00
Records Management	RMF	LGC § 118.052(3)(G)	\$ 5.00
Court Record Preservation Fee	CTRPF	GC § 51.708	\$ 10.00
Courthouse Security Fee	CHS	LGC § 291.008(d)	\$ 5.00
Law Library	LAWLB	LGC § 323.023(a)	\$ 35.00
Judicial Fee	PCJF	GC § 51.703(a)	\$ 40.00
Basic Civil Legal Services for Indigents	SIF	LGC § 133.153(a)(1)	\$ 10.00
Court Reporter Fee	PROB	GC § 51.601(a)	\$ 15.00
Service Fee	CONST	LGC § 181.131	\$ 60.00
Judicial Education Fund	JEF	LGC § 118.064(a),(b)(1)	\$ 5.00
Support for Judiciary	JSFPC	LGC § 133.154(a)	\$ 42.00
Appellate Judicial System Fee	APPJS	GC § 22.2061	\$ 5.00
Supplemental Court Initiated Guardianship	PGF	LGC § 118.052(2)(E)	\$ 20.00
County Judge	Judge	LGC § 118.101	\$ 2.00
State Electronic Fee Fund	SEFCV	GC §51.851(b)	\$ 20.00
Issuing Document	PROB	LGC §118.052(3)(A)	\$ 4.00
Fee includes one posted or published citation			TOTAL \$ 318.00
Charge for each additional issuance of Citation	PROB	LGC §118.052(3)(A)	\$ 4.00
Personal service on each citation in Hunt County	CONST	LGC §118.131	\$ 60.00
Letters of Testamentary, Guardianship, Administration or Abstract of Judgment (once) This does not include the cost of Court Reporting to clerk		LGC § 118.052(3)(D)	\$ 2.00
Wills for Self-Proving			
Filing Fee	CC	LGC § 118.052(3)(E)	\$ 5.00
Record Management	RMF	LGC § 118.052(3)(G)	\$ 5.00
Courthouse Security	CHS	LGC § 291.008(d)	\$ 1.00
TOTAL			\$ 11.00
Open Safety Deposit Box			
Clerk	CC	LGC § 118.011(c)	\$ 8.00
Law Library	LAWLB	LGC § 323.023(a)	\$ 35.00
Record Management	RMF	LGC § 118.052(3)(G)	\$ 5.00
Judge	Judge	LGC § 118.101	\$ 2.00
TOTAL			\$ 50.00
Adverse Action (Cross Action, Intervention, Plea of Privilege, Motion for New Trial)			
Adverse Probate Action	PROB	LGC § 118.052(2)(C)	\$ 40.00
Records Management	RMF	LGC § 118.052(3)(G)	\$ 5.00
Courthouse Security Fee	CHS	LGC § 291.008(a)	\$ 5.00
Basic Civil Legal Services for Indigents	SIF	LGC § 133.153(a)(1)	\$ 10.00
Court Record Preservation Fee	CTRPF	GC § 51.708	\$ 10.00
Supplemental Court Initiated Guardianship	PGF	LGC § 118.052(2)(E)	\$ 20.00
Appellate Judicial System Fee	APPJS	GC § 22.2061	\$ 5.00
State Electronic Fee Fund	SEFCV	GC §51.851(b)	\$ 20.00
Fee does not include any service.			TOTAL \$ 115.00
Charge for each issuance of Citation)	PROB	LGC §118.052(3)(A)	\$ 4.00
Personal service on each citation in Hunt County	CONST	LGC §118.131	\$ 60.00
If Judge's signature required	JUDGE	LGC § 118.101(11)	\$ 2.00

Inventory, Appraisal and list of Claims (after 90th day after Qualification Date)			
Filing Fee	PROB	LGC § 118.052(2)(B)(i)	\$ 25.00
Judge's Fee	JUDGE	LGC § 118.101(11)	\$ 2.00
TOTAL			\$ 27.00
Annual/Final Account of Probate Guardianship (must be approved), Application for Sale of Real or Personal Property (after Order Approving Inventory and Appraisal or after 120th day after initial filing of the action, whichever occurs first)			
Filing Fee	PROB	LGC § 118.052(2)(B)(iv)	\$ 25.00
Judge's Fee	JUDGE	LGC § 118.101(11)	\$ 2.00
TOTAL			\$ 27.00
Annual/Final Report of Guardianship of a Person (must be approved) (after Order Approving Inventory and Appraisal or after 120th day after initial filing of the action, whichever occurs first)			
Filing Fee	PROB	LGC § 118.052(2)(B)(vi)	\$ 10.00
Judge's Fee	JUDGE	LGC § 118.101(11)	\$ 2.00
TOTAL			\$ 12.00
Miscellaneous Filings (after Order Approving Inventory and Appraisal or after 120th day after initial filing of the action, whichever occurs first, IF MORE THAN 23 PAGES)			
Filing Fee	PROB	LGC § 118.052(2)(B)(vii)	\$ 25.00
Judge's Fee	JUDGE	LGC § 118.101(11)	\$ 2.00
TOTAL			\$ 27.00
Claim (paid by the Claimant at time of filing)			
Filing Fee	PROB	LGC § 118.052(2)(D)	\$ 2.00
Foreign Will/ Temporary Guardianship/ Application to sell minor's Interest/ Heirship Determination in so Existing Probate			
Probate Fee Original Action	PROB	LGC § 118.052(2)(A)(i)	\$ 40.00
Records Management	RMF	LGC § 118.052(3)(G)	\$ 5.00
Court Record Preservation Fee	CTRPF	GC § 51.708	\$ 10.00
Court Reporter Fee	PROB	GC § 51.601(a)	\$ 15.00
Courthouse Security Fee	CHS	LGC § 291.008(d)	\$ 5.00
Law Library	LAWLB	LGC § 323.023(a)	\$ 35.00
Judicial Fee	PCJF	GC § 51.703(a)	\$ 40.00
Basic Civil Legal Services for Indigents	SIF	LGC § 133.153(a)(1)	\$ 10.00
Judicial Education Fund	JEF	LGC § 118.064(a),(b)(1)	\$ 5.00
Support for Judiciary	JSFPC	LGC § 133.154(a)	\$ 42.00
Appellate Judicial System Fee	APPJS	GC § 22.2061	\$ 5.00
Supplemental Court Initiated Guardianship	PGF	LGC § 118.052(2)(E)	\$ 20.00
State Electronic Fee Fund	SEFCV	GC § 51.851(b)	\$ 20.00
Fee does not include any service.			
TOTAL			\$ 252.00
Charge for each issuance of Citation	PROB	LGC § 118.052(3)(A)	\$ 4.00
Personal service on each citation in Hunt County	CONST	LGC § 118.131	\$ 60.00
If Judge's signature required	JUDGE	LGC § 118.101(11)	\$ 2.00
Filing Affidavit in Small Estate Records after Approval by Judge			
Probate Fee Original Action	PROB	LGC § 118.052(2)(A)(iii)	\$ 40.00
Records Management	RMF	LGC § 118.052(3)(G)	\$ 5.00
Court Record Preservation Fee	CTRPF	GC § 51.708	\$ 10.00
Courthouse Security Fee	CHS	LGC § 291.008(d)	\$ 5.00
Law Library	LAWLB	LGC § 323.023(a)	\$ 35.00
Judicial Fee	PCJF	GC § 51.703(a)	\$ 40.00
Basic Civil Legal Services for Indigents	SIF	LGC § 133.153(a)(1)	\$ 10.00
Court Reporter Fee	PROB	GC § 51.601(a)	\$ 15.00
Judicial Education Fund	JEF	LGC § 118.064(a),(b)(1)	\$ 5.00
Support for Judiciary	JSFPC	LGC § 133.154(a)	\$ 42.00
Appellate Judicial System Fee	APPJS	GC § 22.2061	\$ 5.00
Supplemental Court Initiated Guardianship	PGF	LGC § 118.052(2)(E)	\$ 20.00

County Judge	JUDGE	LGC § 118.101	\$ 2.00
State Electronic Fee Fund	SEFCV	GC §51.851(b)	\$ 20.00
TOTAL			\$ 254.00
Charge for each issuance of Citation	PROB	LGC §118.052(3)(A)	\$ 4.00
Personal service on each citation in Hunt County	CONST	LGC §118.131	\$ 60.00
Private Professional Guardian Application	PROB	Estates Code §1104.303(b)(2)	\$ 40.00
Mental Illness Filings			
Probate Fee Original Action	MENJV	LGC § 118.052(2)(A)(v)	\$ 40.00
Records Management	RMF	LGC § 118.052(3)(G)	\$ 5.00
Court Record Preservation Fee	CTRPF	GC § 51.708	\$ 10.00
Courthouse Security Fee	CHS	LGC § 291.008(d)	\$ 5.00
Law Library	LAWLB	LGC § 323.023(a)	\$ 35.00
Judicial Fee	PCJF	GC § 51.703(a)	\$ 40.00
Basic Civil Legal Services for Indigents	SIF	LGC § 133.153(a)(1)	\$ 10.00
Court Reporter Fee	MENJV	GC § 51.601(a)	\$ 15.00
Judicial Education Fund	JEF	LGC § 118.064(a),(b)(1)	\$ 5.00
Support for Judiciary	JSFPC	LGC § 133.154(a)	\$ 42.00
Supplemental Court Initiated Guardianship	PGF	LGC § 118.052(2)(E)	\$ 20.00
Sheriff's Fee	PROB	LGC § 181.131	\$ 60.00
County Judge	JUDGE	LGC § 118.101	\$ 2.00
Appellate Judicial System Fee	APPJS	GC § 22.2061	\$ 5.00
County Attorney Fee	CA	HSC §574.031	\$ 50.00
Court Appointed Attorney Fees	ATTRY	HSC §574.031	\$ 200.00
State Electronic Fee Fund	SEFCV	GC §51.851(b)	\$ 20.00
TOTAL			\$ 564.00
Civil Court/ Occupational License/ Marriage License/ Foreign Judgment/ Real Property			
Civil Fee Original Action	CIVIL	LGC § 118.052(1)(A)(ii)	\$ 40.00
Records Management	RMF	LGC § 118.052(3)(G)	\$ 5.00
Court Record Preservation Fee	CTRPF	GC § 51.708	\$ 10.00
Courthouse Security Fee	CHS	LGC § 291.008(d)	\$ 5.00
Law Library	LAWLB	LGC § 323.023(a)	\$ 35.00
Judicial Fee	PCJF	GC § 51.703(a)	\$ 40.00
Basic Civil Legal Services for Indigents	SIF	LGC § 133.153(a)(1)	\$ 10.00
Court Reporter Fee	CIVIL	GC § 51.601(a)	\$ 15.00
Appellate Judicial System Fee	APPJS	GC § 22.2061	\$ 5.00
Support for Judiciary	JSFPC	LGC § 133.154(a)	\$ 42.00
County Judge	JUDGE	LGC § 118.101	\$ 2.00
State Electronic Fee Fund	SEFCV	GC §51.851(b)	\$ 20.00
Fee does not include any service.			TOTAL \$ 229.00
Charge for each issuance of Citation	CIVIL	LGC §118.052(3)(A)	\$ 4.00
Personal service on each citation in Hunt County	CONST	LGC §118.131	\$ 60.00
Cross Actions, Interventions, Filings of Privileges or Motions for New Trial			
Filing of action other than original	CIVIL	LGC § 118.052(1)(B)	\$ 30.00
Records Management	RMF	LGC § 118.052(3)(G)	\$ 5.00
Court Record Preservation Fee	CTRPF	GC § 51.708	\$ 10.00
Courthouse Security Fee	CHS	LGC § 291.008(d)	\$ 5.00
Basic Civil Legal Services for Indigents	SIF	LGC § 133.153(a)(1)	\$ 10.00
State Electronic Fee Fund	SEFCV	GC §51.851(b)	\$ 20.00
Fee does not include any service.			TOTAL \$ 80.00
Charge for each issuance of Citation	CIVIL	LGC §118.052(3)(A)	\$ 4.00
Personal service on each citation in Hunt County	CONST	LGC §118.131	\$ 60.00
If Judge's signature required	JUDGE	LGC § 118.101(11)	\$ 2.00
Non-disclosure Petition			

Filed only as a new civil filing			\$ 229.00
Nondisclosure Fee	NDF	GC § 411.081(d)	\$ 28.00
		TOTAL	\$ 257.00
Application for Turnover Order & Injunctive Relief		LGC §118.052(1)(B)	\$ 30.00
If Judge's signature required		JUDGE	LGC § 118.101
Writ of Garnishment....This fee is the same as a New Civil filing fee of \$229.00 plus a \$15.00 for preparing the Writ		LGC § 118.052(1)(A)(i)	\$ 244.00
No Writ of Garnishment shall be issued before final Judgment until the party applying has filed with the Clerk an order signed by the Court after a hearing. The Court shall further find in its order the amount of bond required payable to the Defendant in the amount fixed by the Court Order.			
Jury Fee		JURY	216 TEXAS RULES OF COURT & 51.604 GC
			\$ 22.00
SERVICE BY CERTIFIED MAIL	Mail Service of Process same as Sheriff	LGC §118.052(3)(F)	\$ 60.00
SERVICE DOCUMENTS: Citation; Notice; Commission to take Deposition; Show Cause; Subpoena; Precept to Serve; Temporary Restraining Order; Process; or other instrument or paper authorized or required to be issued by the Clerk	Issuing before judgment/County Clerk	LGC §118.052(3)(A)	\$ 4.00
	Issuing after judgment/County Clerk	LGC §118.052(1)(C)	\$ 5.00
Registry Funds		Clerk receives 10% of the interest earned when closed	LGC 117.054(b)(1)
Deposit/Withdrawal with Court Order Only			

#13,550

HUNT COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
P.O. BOX 1097 - GREENVILLE, TX 75403
903-408-4195

FILED FOR RECORD
at 10:35o'clock A M

JAN 27 2015

JENNIFER LINDENZWEIG
County Clerk, Hunt County, Tex.
By *Jennifer Lindenzweig*

County Road # or Name

CR 4813	Upgrade Road Change =	<i>dirt to Rock</i>
	Upgrade Bridge Change =	
COUNTY RD IMPROVEMENT >\$50,000.00 PER MILE		

Labor				
Classification	Hours	Hourly Rate	Total Cost	Notes
<i>driver</i>	<i>2</i>	<i>14</i>	<i>28.00</i>	
<i>operator</i>	<i>1.8</i>		<i>11.20</i>	
Grand Total				

Equipment				
Type & Model	Hours	Hourly Rate	Total Cost	Notes
<i>haul truck</i>	<i>2</i>	<i>40</i>	<i>80</i>	
<i>grader</i>	<i>1.6</i>	<i>45</i>	<i>72</i>	
Grand Total				

Materials				
Type	Quantity	Unit Cost	Total Cost	Notes
<i>Rock</i>	<i>16.7</i>	<i>8.50</i>	<i>142</i>	
Grand Total			<i>142</i>	

TOTAL COST OF UPGRADE =

New Surface Area	Dirt	Rock	Oil Sand	Seal Coat
	<i>3.07</i>	<i>.246</i>		

TOTAL MILES OF ROAD = (Should match original mileage)

New Structure	Steel Bridge	Concrete Bridge	Tank Cars	Concrete Box Culvert

Submitted By:

Jim Kathan

Title:

Commissioner

Date:

12-17-14

**HUNT COUNTY
BID AWARD**

FILED FOR RECORD
at 10:35 o'clock A M

**FORMAL BID NO.124-15, RECYCLED ASPHALT AND CONCRETE
UNDELIVERED / DELIVERED
Effective 2/12/15 through 2/11/16**

JAN 27 2015

JENNIFER LINDENZWEIG
County Clerk, Hunt County, TX
By [Signature]

PRECINCT	VENDOR	RECYCLED ASPHALT PER TON UNDELIVERED	RECYCLED CONCRETE PER TON UNDELIVERED	RECYCLED ASPHALT/ CONCRETE PER TON DELIVERED	Pick - Up Point	INTERLOCAL ALLOWED
All	Big City Concrete	\$5.95	No Bid	No Bid	11143 Goodnight Ln Dallas, TX 75229	No
All	Big City Concrete Congress	\$7.00	\$7.00	No Bid	1005 Forest Ave. Dallas, TX 75215	No
All	Materials LLC Southwest	\$6.00	\$8.50	No Bid	3637 Castle Dr Garland	Yes
All	Crushing SPI Asphalt, LLC	\$9.00**	\$10.00**	No Bid	200 N. Lawson Rd Sunnyvale, TX 75182	No
Pct 1	SPI Asphalt, LLC	\$9.75	\$15.21	\$24.96 / \$30.71	Justin, TX	No
Pct 2	SPI Asphalt, LLC	\$9.75	\$15.21	\$24.96 / \$30.71	Justin, TX	No
Pct 3	SPI Asphalt, LLC	\$9.75	\$15.21	\$24.96 / \$30.71	Justin, TX	No
Pct 4	SPI Asphalt, LLC	\$9.75	No Bid	\$24.96 / No Bid	Justin, TX	No

**If available. SWC does not guarantee quantities. SWC can only guarantee prices

All prices are FOB Pick-up Points from all vendors.

The Purchasing Department recommends award of this bid to all bidders in accordance with Local Government Code §262.027 e